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FOI Ref: 6076
Category(ies):Clinical – Performance Data 
Subject: DTOC
Date Received: 02/11/2021 

	[bookmark: _Hlk66456130]Your request:

	Our response:


	1.      For each month in 2021 for which data is held, please state the number of ‘delayed days’ in acute care that month due to delayed transfers of care

	The Trust does not hold this data.

	2.      Please provide any breakdown the Trust holds of the question 1 data by reason for the delay (e.g. awaiting care package in own home, patient or family choice etc)
	The Trust does not hold this data.

	3.      For each month in 2021 for which data is held, please state the number of ‘delayed days’ in non-acute care that month due to delayed transfers of care

	The Trust does not hold this data.

	4.      Please provide any breakdown the Trust holds of the question 3 data by reason for the delay (e.g. awaiting care package in own home, patient or family choice etc)

	The Trust does not hold this data.

	5.      For each month in 2021 for which data is held, please state the number of ‘DTOC beds’ in acute care that month

	The Trust does not hold this data.

	6.      For each month in 2021 for which data is held, please state the number of ‘DTOC beds’ in non-acute care that month

	The Trust does not hold this data.

	
	

	
	


[bookmark: _GoBack]This FOI request is based on the data that the Trust holds. I am aware that national reporting of delayed transfers statistics remains suspended during the pandemic, but it is possible that Trusts have maintained or resumed internal monitoring.
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