[image: ]

FOI Ref:  5135
Category(ies):  Clinical – Performance Data
Subject:  Sepsis
Date Received:  20 January 2020

Decision:

The Rotherham NHS Foundation Trust does not hold the information that you have requested and our response below is provided on this basis:


	Your request:

	Our response:


	1.       What percentage of patients with suspected sepsis were treated with antibiotics within one hour in a) 2019 and b) 2018? 

	


The Rotherham NHS Foundation Trust are unable to provide this information as the data is not recorded.
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	2.       Please provide the above figure as a raw number – what was the total number of patients with suspected sepsis who were treated with antibiotics within one hour in a) 2019 and b) 2018?

	

	3.       What was the total number of patients with suspected sepsis who waited longer than an hour for antibiotics in a) 2019 and b) 2018?

	

	4.       If possible, please state the longest delay for a patient with suspected sepsis before receiving antibiotics in a) 2019 and b) 2018?
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